
Bid Proposal Form D 

Electrical Services for this Bid only - Bid #ESCNJ 18/19-09 

Bid Proposal Form D - Installation/Electrical Services 

F o I ey ,I nco rpo rated 

855 Centennial Avenue 

Piscataway, NJ 08854 

PLEASE ENTER THE% MARKUP RATE FOR JOURNEYMAN, APPRENTICE, AND FOREMAN FOR THE 

ELECTRIC TRADE. RESPONDENTS MAY BID IN ANY OR ALL OF THE COUNTIES LISTED.* 

DPMC Classification: Electrician 

Check here if No Bid for Form D: ✓ 
Journeyman Apprentice Foreman 

Year One Year Two Year One Year Two Year One Year Two 

COUNTY 

ATLANTIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BERGEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BURLINGTON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAMDEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAPE MAY 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CUMBERLAND 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

ESSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

GLOUCESTER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUDSON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

IDJNTERDON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MERCER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MIDDLESEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MONMOUTH 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MORRIS 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

OCEAN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

PASSAIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SALEM 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SOMERSET 13% 13% 11% 13% 13% 13% 

SUSSEX 13% 11% 11% 13% 13% 13% 

UNION 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

WARREN 11% 11% 11% 13% 13% 13% 

*Bidders not providing service in a particular county should insert "NO BID" on this form. The absence of either a zero (0) or any

other number in any of the cells in this form will be interpreted as "NO BID" for that particular county and/or trade category.

ESCNJ Co-op Members are located throughout all twenty-one (21) counties in New Jersey. This RFP may be awarded on a County or regional basis. You 

may not submit more than one bid per County. Include the ESCNJ fee (1 %) in your pricing. 

By: Joe Amabile

(Printed name) � 

'\ I\ r: LJ . (? 
Authorized 1gn ��

--

Title: Vice President of Power Systems
-----------------

Date: _ __,S:
......___

-
-=
b1

:;.._
�_,_-/

____...
C,

'---
-----

Failure to sign the bid form may render the bid non-responsive. 

ESCNJ 18/19- 9 
Generators Eq · ent and Maintenance 

May 24, 2018@ 10:00 a.m. 
Page 60 of 64 

Educational Services Commission of New Jersey

NJ State Approved Cooperative Pricing System #65MCESCCPS Bid Term: 6/30/18 - 6/29/20 - 

Extended through 6/29/21
Extended to 6/29/22



Educational Services Commission of New Jersey 
NJ State Approved Cooperative Pricing System #65MCESCCPS

Bid Proposal Form E 

Plumbing Services - for this Bid only - Bid #ESCNJ 18/19-09 

Bid Proposal Form E - Installation/Plumbing Services 

Foley ,Incorporated 
855 Centennial Avenue 
Piscataway, NJ 08854 

PLEASE ENTER THE % MARKUP RA TE FOR JOURNEYMAN, APPRENTICE, AND FOREMAN FOR THE 

PLUMBING TRADE. RESPONDENTS MAY BID rN ANY OR ALL OF THE COUNTIES LISTED.* 

DPMC CI .fi f ass1 1ca ion: um mg PI b. 

Check here if No Bid for all of Form E: ✓

Journeyman Apprentice Foreman 

Year One Year Two Year One Year Two Year One Year Two 

COUNTY 
ATLANTIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BERGEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BURLINGTON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAMDEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAPE MAY 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CUMBERLAND 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

ESSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

GLOUCESTER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUDSON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HlJNTERDON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MERCER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MIDDLESEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MONMOUTH 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MORRIS 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

OCEAN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

PASSAIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SALEM 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SOMERSET 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SUSSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

UNION 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

WARREN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

*Bidders not providing service in a particular county should insert "NO BID" on this form. The absence of either a zero (0) or

any other number in any of the cells in this form will be interpreted as "NO BID" for that particular county and/or trade

category.

ESCNJ Co-op Members are located throughout all twenty-one (21) counties in New Jersey. This RFP may be awarded on a County or regional basis. You 
may not submit more than one bid per County. Include the ESCNJ fee (l %) in your pricing. 

By: Joe Amabile

(Printed name) 
Title: Vice President of Power Systems

Date: -��-----�¢�of.�· .... _-_/ ....... f!�-; _______ _

Failure to sign the bid form may render the bid non-responsive. 

ESCNJ 18/19-09 May 24, 2018@ 10:00 a.m. 
Generators Equipment and Maintenance Page 61 of 64 



Educational Services Commission of New Jersey 
NJ State Approved Cooperative Pricing System #65MCESCCPS                           Foley,lncorporated

  844 Centennial Avenue 
      Piscataway, NJ 08854

Bid Proposal Form G 

Rigging Services - for this Bid only - Bid #ESCNJ 18/19-09 

Bid Proposal Form G - Rigging Services 

PLEASE ENTER THE % MARKUP RA TE FOR JOURNEYMAN, APPRENTICE, AND FOREMAN FOR THE RIGGING 

TR
A

DE. RESPONDENTS MAY BID IN ANY OR ALL OF THE COUNTIES LISTED.* 

DPMC Cl .fi f Ri ass1 1ca 10n: l!!!!lll2

Check here if No Bid for all of Form G: ✓

Journeyman Apprentice Foreman 

Year one Year two Year one Year two Year one Year two 

COUNTY 

ATLANTIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BERGEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BURLINGTON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAMDEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAPE MAY 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CUMBERLAND 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

ESSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

GLOUCESTER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUDSON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUNTERDON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MERCER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MIDDLESEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MONMOUTH 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MORRIS 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

OCEAN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

PASSAIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SALEM 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SOMERSET 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SUSSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

UNION 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

WARREN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

*Bidders not providing service in a particular county should insert "NO BID" on this form. The absence of either a zero (0) or

any other number in any of the cells in this form will be interpreted as "NO BID" for that particular county and/or trade 

category. 

ESCNJ Co-op Members are located throughout all twenty-one (21) counties in New Jersey. This RFP may be awarded on a

County or regional basis. You may not submit more than one bid per County. Include the ESCNJ fee (1 %) in your pricing.

By: Joe Amabile Title: -----------------
Vice President of Power Systems 

(Printed le)
� � IL- p Date: __ 5""------''Z..)�J.'--�-J =�----� ________ _

Failure to sign the bid form may render the bid non-responsive.Authori

�

� §;g: lllrY

ESCNJ 1 /19- 9 
May 24, 2018 @ 10:00 a.m. 
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Educational Services Commission of New Jersey 
NJ State Approved Cooperative Pricing System #65MCESCCPS 

Bid Proposal Form H 

Rigging Services - for this Bid only - Bid #ESCNJ 18/19-09

Bid Proposal Form H - Mason Services

Foley ,Incorporated 
855 Centennial Avenue 
Piscataway, NJ 08854 

PLEASE ENTER THE % MARKUP RA TE FOR JOURNEYMAN, APPRENTICE, AND FOREMAN FOR THE RIGGING 

TRADE. RESPONDENTS MAY BID IN ANY OR ALL OF THE COUNTIES LISTED.* 

DPMC Classification: Mason 

Check here if No Bid for all of Form H: ✓

Journeyman Apprentice Foreman 

Year one Year two Year one Year two Year one Year two 

COUNTY 

ATLANTIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BERGEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

BURLINGTON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAMDEN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CAPE MAY 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

CUMBERLAND 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

ESSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

GLOUCESTER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUDSON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

HUNTERDON 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MERCER 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MIDDLESEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MONMOUTH 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

MORRIS 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

OCEAN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

PASSAIC 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SALEM 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SOMERSET 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

SUSSEX 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

UNION 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

WARREN 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 13% 

*Bidders not providing service in a particular county should insert "NO BID" on this form. The absence of either a zero (0) or

any other number in any of the cells in this form will be interpreted as "NO BID" for that particular county and/or trade

category. 

ESCNJ Co-op Members are located throughout all twenty-one (21) counties in New Jersey. This RFP may be awarded on a

County or regional basis. You may not submit more than one bid per County. Include the ESCNJ fee (1 %) in your pricing.

By: Joe Amabile Title: ,Vice President of Power Systems

(Printed na�e) 

Authorized ign . .____.... 
/' L2 · P Date: _5"'.

_.___
.,.,.___,3:""-�=---........ -/_,__B_,,___ ____ _ 

ESCNJ 18 -09 
May 24, 2018@ 10:00 a.m. 

Generators Equipment and Maintenance Page 64 of64 



Educational Services Commission of New Jersey 

NJ State Approved Cooperative Pricing System#65MCESCCPS           Foley, lncorporated 
855 Centennial Avenue 
Piscataway, NJ 08854 

Bid Proposal Form F - Engineering Services

Engineering Services - for this Bid only - Bid #ESNJ 18/19-09 

PLEASE BID AN HOURLY SERVICE RATE FOR ENGINEERING. 

Check here if No Bid for all of Form F: ✓ 

Year one Year two 

COUNTY $ $ 

ATLANTIC $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

BERGEN $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

BURLINGTON $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

CAMDEN $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

CAPE MAY $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

CUMBERLAND $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

ESSEX $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

GLOUCESTER $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

HUDSON $ 212.Rt:; $ 212.65 

HUNTERDON $ 212 Fit; $ 212.65 

MERCER $ ?1? n!1 $ 212.65 

MIDDLESEX $ 212 Fit; $ 212.65 

MONMOUTH $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

MORRIS $ 212 i:;i:; $ 212.65 

OCEAN $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

PASSAIC $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

SALEM $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

SOMERSET $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

SUSSEX $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

UNION $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

WARREN $ 212.65 $ 212.65 

*Bidders not providing service in a particular county should insert "NO BID" on this form. The absence of either a zero (0) or

any other number in any of the cells in this form will be interpreted as "NO BID" for that particular county and/or trade

category.

ESCNJ Co-op Members are located throughout all twenty-one (21) counties in New Jersey. This RFP may be awarded on a 
County or regional basis. You may not submit more than one bid per County. Include the ESCNJ fee (1 %) in your pricing. 

By: Joseph Amabile Title: __ V_ic_e _P_re_s_id_e_n_t _______ _
(Printed �ame) 

) /7A /" J/· P Date: ___ 5_/2_2/_18 _______ _ 
Authori

/�sfi/r;:uYe

u-
Failure to sign the bid form may render the bid non-responsive.
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